
Wednesday, May 4, 2022 
Announcements 

Yearbook 

Faculty Section 

Group C has duty this week 

Hey Dons:  The last order of our Yearbook is almost 
completely sold out.  No more books will be purchased.  There 
are 18 left!  If you have been waiting for the right time, it is 
now.  Please go to yearbookforever.com to purchase before 
they are all gone.  After May 23rd they will no longer be 
available online and you will need to purchase in person with 
cash.  The price will increase to $100 on May 24th.  So stop 
delaying! 
 
 
 
DONS:  This year the Yearbook Class is throwing our first 
ever SIGNING PARTY!!  You’ll be able to pick up your book 
after school and enjoy some time with all of your friends 
getting your book signed.  We will have food for sale, 
throwback music, memorabilia, a photo booth and more.  
Admission is free with the purchase of a yearbook, so buy 
yours now at yearbookforever.com. 

Please Release The Following 

Varsity Badminton 

@ 1:15 

Boys Varsity Tennis 

@ 1:00 

This week we celebrate Teacher Appreciation Week.  We want 
to thank our teachers for everything they do!  We want you to 
know that you are loved and appreciated.  Thank you for your 
hard work and dedication, it does not go unnoticed. 
 
Students:  Have you heard of the School Site Council?  We 
need three student reps for next year to attend monthly 
meetings and provide the student perspective on various 
issues.  The School Site Council includes staff, parents and  
Mr. Pratt.  The student reps should be articulate, outspoken 
and good listeners, with the ability to represent multiple 
student groups on campus.  Interested?  Come to ASB this 
week for details. 
 
Hello ALL Students:  Have you ever thought about a career in 
astrophysics or astronomy or the possibility of working for 
NASA?  An astrophysics student from Pomona College in 
Claremont and an intern at Carnegie Observatory in 
Pasadena is coming to speak with our students about her 
research, the Carnegie Observatories and her educational 
pathway.  The remaining time will be used for a Q&A where 
she will answer questions about astrophysics, college and her 
experiences.  The presentation will take place during 5th 
period on Thursday, May 5th.  Please sign up TODAY in the 
Counseling Office with Mrs. Sandra Anaya.  Don’t miss out on 
this once in a lifetime opportunity. 
 
Attention Seniors:  The Baldwin Park Unified School District 
offers a commendation which students may earn upon 
graduation from high school for their biliteracy skills.  
Qualifying students receive a Medallion, a Certificate and a 
Seal on their diploma.  If you qualify to receive the Biliteracy 
Recognition Seal, you must submit a completed application to 
your counselor by May 17th.  Applications are available in the 
Counseling Office. 

Varsity Badminton League Prelims 
  @ Nogales - 2:00 
 
 
 
 
 
Boys Varsity Tennis CIF   
   
 
 
 

Sports 

If you are interested in joining Drumline, Color Guard or 
Band, we will have workshops starting this Wednesday, 
May 4th, from 5:00pm- 8:00pm.  All students are welcome 
to attend.  See Ms. Gomez in the Band Room for more 
information. 
 
Just a Reminder:  If you are interested in playing chess or 
learning how to play chess, come to Room 610 at Lunch on 
Fridays.  Everyone is welcome to join. 
 
C.S.F. will be holding officer elections for the next school 
year.  If you are interested in running for a position, please 
check our Instagram page @svhscsf for more information 
and to complete the form in our bio by the end of TODAY.  
Elections will be held tomorrow during Lunch in Room 
506.  Members MUST attend in order to vote. 

Clubs & Activities 


